
The harms of private equity in healthcare 

Madam Chair and members of the committee, thank you for the invitation.  

My name is Olivia Kosloff, and I am a senior fellow at the American Economic Liberties 
Project. I appreciate the opportunity to explain how private equity acquisitions of healthcare 
assets — including hospitals and physician practices — harm patients, communities, and the 
stability of regional and rural healthcare infrastructure. 

Private equity firms often present themselves as a solution to struggling providers to bring new 
investment into the system. However, private equity firms are structured to make a return on 
their investment as quickly as possible. The incentive is not for long-term community investment 
but for a quick stripping of the acquired asset to turn a profit within a few years. This often 
leaves practices and hospitals worse off than before, and it can leave patients with nowhere to 
turn. 

How private equity typically operates in health care 

Private equity practices are a type of financial institution premised on finding underutilized 
assets and quickly making a profit from them. Private equity acquisitions are typically leveraged 
buy-outs, or LBOs. This means that private equity purchases the asset with debt and uses the 
purchased entity’s own assets as collateral for the debt. In other words, the purchased hospital 
takes on all of the risk, but with no guarantee of benefit. 

Private equity funds usually seek to turn around their investment in 3-7 years — meaning a very 
short time horizon. This incentivizes value extraction, rather than value creation. Private equity 
shops are not sticking around to make long-term bets about keeping communities healthy or 
serving, for example, an elderly rural population. Instead, they’re making money with the most 
extractive, quickest means possible.  

Standard strategies include selling the real estate under which a practice sits — and then leasing 
the land back to the practice at an exorbitant rate (also known as sale-leaseback), extracting 
management and monitoring fees from the practice, consolidating back-office functions, cutting 
staffing and labor hours, raising prices, and aggressively billing patients.1 None of these 
strategies are intended to make the hospital or physician practice run more smoothly or 
efficiently, and none of them represent investment in the future of the practice — because again, 
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the private equity model is explicitly premised on not being around for the future, but making as 
much money as possible in the short term.  

After private equity has bled all profit it can from the system, it exits or sells the asset — leaving 
the patients, providers, and communities much worse off than before.  

Private equity firms have shown particular interest in assets with defined billing practices, or 
which are procedure- or medication-heavy. The greatest concentration of private equity 
acquisitions has been among hospital-based physicians in specialties like emergency medicine, 
anesthesiology, and radiology; office-based specialties with a heavy procedure component like 
gastroenterology, dermatology, and ophthalmology; and behavioral health and opioid treatment 
programs.2 The number of opioid treatment programs with private equity investment in the U.S. 
has jumped from less than 1% to nearly 20% from 2011 to 2022.3 Private equity has also 
acquired approximately 13% of nursing homes in the U.S. as of this year, up from less than 1% 
in 2005.4  

Overall investment has also skyrocketed: from 2000 to 2018, private equity investment in 
healthcare grew by 2000%.5 

In my testimony, I’ll focus on private equity acquisitions of hospitals, physician practices, and 
nursing homes, although private equity has also caused harm through acquiring emergency 
medical transport, emergency outpatient departments, dentistry practices, and other types of 
medical services.6 
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Evidence of harms 

There are four areas where strong evidence of harm has emerged: patient safety and quality, 
increased costs, loss of access especially in rural areas, and workforce disruptions. 

First, patient safety and quality of care. 

A major talking point by those in favor of private equity acquisitions of hospitals is that it can 
rescue struggling assets and maintain patient access to care. But a growing body of evidence 
shows that the care provided by private equity-owned hospitals is inferior to that provided by 
other hospitals. A study published in the Journal of the American Medical Association in 2023 
found that Medicare beneficiaries admitted to private-equity owned hospitals experienced a 25% 
increase in hospital-acquired conditions compared to those treated at control hospitals, including 
a 27% increase in falls and a 37% increase in certain infections.7  

Private equity seems to particularly affect emergency or high-intensity care. One study, 
published in Health Affairs in 2025, found that private equity acquisition was associated with a 
2.7% increase in postoperative mortality, particularly with emergent surgeries.8 Another study 
found that Medicare beneficiaries in a private equity-owned emergency department saw an 
additional 7 deaths per 10,000 visits after the acquisition, and more frequent transfers to other 
hospitals from private equity-owned emergency departments and intensive care units.9 

Patients have also reported worse quality and staff responsiveness at private equity-owned 
hospitals.10 In private equity-owned nursing homes, patients experienced higher mortality, higher 
costs, and more emergency department visits compared to patients in other for-profit homes.11 

Second, staffing cuts. 

The harms I previously described affect patients. But these specific harms are closely linked with 
a common private equity tactic — decreasing staffing, which affects providers as well. 
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Proponents of private equity acquisition will often refer to cutting out the bloat from systems and 
streamlining efficiencies. In the best case scenario, that represents lost jobs. In the worst case 
scenario, that represents fewer care professionals to manage patients, watch for infections, and 
relieve the burnout experienced by too many healthcare providers. A 2024 survey of doctors by 
the Physicians Foundation found that over two-thirds of respondents said consolidation was 
impacting patient access in a negative way, and only 14% of physicians said that private equity is 
good for the future of healthcare. Half of physicians reported that a merger or acquisition 
reduced their job satisfaction, and only 14% reported that it improved their job satisfaction.12 

Staffing cuts are particularly prevalent in nursing home acquisitions, where it is easier for private 
equity owners to trim staffing levels without much oversight. Recent studies have shown that 
private equity ownership of nursing homes leads to a lower-risk patient population — with 
increased mortality. This is linked to declines in nurse staffing and lower compliance with care 
standards.13 Research by the U.S. Department of Health and Human Services found that private 
equity investment led to a 12% relative decline in registered nurse hours per resident day, 
compared to other for-profit nursing homes.14 

A study in the Annals of Internal Medicine published this year found that private equity hospitals 
reduced emergency department salaries by more than 18% after acquisition and reduced hospital-
wide average pay for full-time employees by nearly 12%.15 

For physicians, private equity acquisition leads to more churn in acquired practices and greater 
replacement of physicians with advanced practice professionals, who are often less expensive to 
hire.16 

Furthermore, this churn continues even after private equity acquires and then sells the practice. 
Although the private equity acquirer may embed incentives for physicians to stay for the duration 
of the acquisition period, these incentives often disappear once the acquirer sells the practice 
again. One recent study found that physicians employed in a practice that was acquired by 
private equity were more than 16% less likely to continue to work at that practice two years after 
acquisition.17 The authors of the study suggest that it may be because many of the firms sold by 
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private equity were sold to other private equity investors: “Practices sold by PE tend to have 
fewer assets and more liabilities, reducing potential investment in practice-related activities and 
heightening the risk of subsequent instability (e.g., bankruptcy)...Physicians may want to 
consider these possibilities before involving PE in their practice.”  

In other words, a private equity acquisition has long-term implications for the stability of the 
physician workforce in a particular community, even years after the ownership change. 

Third, increased costs. 

Perhaps the cut in care quality and physician and workforce wellbeing would be justifiable if 
private equity actually lowered costs in the system. However, private equity-driven consolidation 
has been shown to raise costs. Consolidated hospitals charge insurers more, driving up costs 
across an entire area, even among independent hospitals.18 Costs also go up at private equity-
owned physician practices, with one study showing a rise of 4-16% in dermatology, 
gastroenterology, and oncology practices, with even greater cost increases when the private 
equity firm controls a significant share of the local market.19 Private equity-owned practices also 
tend to prescribe more expensive drugs, increasing cost to Medicare.20 

Fourth, access, closures, and community impact. 

Hospitals are regionally interconnected infrastructure. When a private equity-owned system 
accumulates heavy debt, it can be vulnerable to insolvency or forced asset sales that disrupt 
continuity of care. Private equity ownership strips health systems of their cash on hand (one 
study found that nursing homes’ cash on hand declines by an average of 38% after an 
acquisition) and of their capital assets (a 2024 study found that two years after acquisition, 61% 
of the private equity-owned hospitals in the study had reduced capital assets compared to 15.5% 
of control hospitals).21 Because of the sale-leaseback model, nursing home lease payments go up 
by an average of 75% post-buyout.22 
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Rural communities are often overrepresented among those served by private equity-owned 
hospitals, with nearly 30% of private equity-owned hospitals serving rural areas.23 These 
transactions can result in service reductions, layoffs, or hospital closures, which directly increase 
travel times and can reduce access to emergency and specialty care.  

Private equity-backed companies have been involved in 7 of the 8 largest bankruptcies in 
healthcare. Private equity is also behind 21% of all bankruptcies in healthcare in 2024.24 

Prevalence in New Mexico 

These factors are heightened in New Mexico. According to the Private Equity Stakeholder 
Project, New Mexico has the highest share of hospitals and nursing homes owned by private 
equity of any state in the U.S. — more than 36% of New Mexican hospitals and more than 35% 
of nursing homes.25 Many of these are psychiatric and behavioral health facilities in 
Albuquerque.  

A report released by the Democrats on the Joint Economic Committee in 2024, led by then-
Chairman Senator Martin Heinrich from New Mexico, found that New Mexico was the state 
“most threatened” by private equity, an analysis supported by the Private Equity Stakeholder 
Project’s risk assessment, which ranked New Mexico at a 100/100 risk level.26 

One example is Memorial Medical Center in Las Cruces. This is a 199 bed hospital that is 
managed by Lifepoint Health, which was acquired by private equity firm Apollo Global 
Management in 2018.27 Through its ownership of Lifepoint and health system chain called Scion 
Health, Apollo owns approximately 220 hospitals across 36 states, including Memorial, Los 
Alamos Medical Center, and Kindred Hospital Albuquerque.28 The Senate Budget Committee 
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released a bipartisan report earlier this year, finding mismanagement of Apollo-owned hospitals, 
even as Apollo has “profited immensely from its ownership of the portfolio of hospitals.”29 

Locals have also raised concerns about Memorial Medical Center. Peter Goodman, a lawyer and 
newspaper contributor, has written in the Las Cruces Sun-News about anecdotally reported 
overuse of cardiac procedures and a disproportionate share of children admitted to the pediatric 
intensive care unit.30 Executive Director and founder of Las Cruces-based CARE, a cancer 
patient advocacy nonprofit Yolanda Diaz has flagged that cancer patients at Memorial Medical 
Center have been denied care due to funding issues or a lack of insurance. Her work, in addition 
to an NBC News report in June 2024 highlighting 13 patients who were turned away for care or 
who were forced to pay upfront, led State Attorney General Raúl Torres to launch an 
investigation.31 Shortly after the investigation began, CEO John Harris stepped down, 
announcing his retirement.32 

Several other investigations have been reported into Memorial Medical Center, including by the 
city of Las Cruces.33 According to the NBC News investigation into the hospital, Memorial 
charged 6.7x its cost for care in 2021, even higher than the average among for-profit hospitals 
across the U.S. Costs per Medicare beneficiary at Memorial are almost 20% higher than the state 
average, but Memorial only receives two out of five stars in the Centers for Medicare and 
Medicaid Services ranking.34 

Until 2024, as members of the committee well know, New Mexico did not have an oversight 
process for healthcare transactions. In 2024, the legislature enacted SB 15, which temporarily 
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authorized the Office of Superintendent of Insurance and New Mexico’s Health Care Authority 
to review and approve or deny mergers and acquisitions involving hospitals.  

Following listening sessions and additional legislative work, Senator Katy Duhigg, 
Representative Reena Szczepanski, and Representative Christine Chandler sponsored HB 586, 
which made the state’s oversight authority permanent, expanded oversight to acquisitions of 
healthcare practices by an insurer, and increased transparency. 

Recommendations 

New Mexico’s current oversight process is a key initial step in protecting New Mexican patients, 
providers, and hospitals.  

However, further steps are needed to protect New Mexicans from the harms associated with 
private equity. While HB 586 allows oversight authority, it does not prevent acquisitions by 
private equity owners. New Mexico also does not have a law on the books banning the corporate 
practice of medicine — or the ability for corporations or organizations run by non-physicians to 
manage practices — unlike many other states. 

Oregon recently passed a corporate practice of medicine (CPOM) law, SB 951, that prevents 
management services organizations (MSOs), which are a typical vehicle for private equity 
ownership, from exercising operational control over professional clinical organizations (PCs), or 
owning or controlling a PC with which the MSO has a contract. This is one option to expand on 
HB 586. 

Other, more incremental measures could include expanding New Mexico’s oversight process to 
physician practices, nursing homes, and other frequent private equity acquisition targets like 
dentistry practices.  

State-based site-neutral payment policies — or paying independent physicians and hospital 
systems the same Medicaid rate — would even the playing field for independent physicians and 
reduce the incentive to consolidate, making it easier for independent physicians to practice the 
way they want to. It would also ensure that rural providers could receive the same payments as 
consolidated hospitals, helping keep a lifeline to rural care open.  

Banning non-competes in New Mexico are another option. While New Mexico holds that non-
competes affecting healthcare professionals are generally unenforceable, banning non-competes 
across the state, for both low- and high-wage workers, can foster economic dynamism and 
growth.35  
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Finally, under current New Mexico law, the Health Care Authority and the Office of the 
Superintendent of Insurance have oversight ability and the ability to add conditions to the 
approval of a transaction. These conditions should be carefully tailored to the individual 
transaction and could include: requirements for investment in the hospital infrastructure; time 
requirements to ensure the purchaser remains invested in the hospital for years; limits on sale-
leaseback transactions to prevent loading the acquired hospital with debt; limits on dividend 
recapitalizations, cash payouts, and arbitrary management fees; ongoing staffing requirements to 
prevent the loss of jobs by people in the community of the acquired hospital; and requirements 
for ongoing patient care provision, to prevent another Memorial Medical Center situation. 

In summary, private equity ownership introduces an incentive model that is in direct 
contradiction to healthcare goals of increased quality and access with reduced costs, but there is 
an opportunity to save New Mexican hospitals, providers, and patients by using the legislative 
power available to preserve this essential resource of healthcare. Thank you so much for your 
time, and I’m happy to answer any questions. 
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